
Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing 6003 OF 
Asphaltic Concrete

Opening Date:  02/28/19
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                   AWARD                AWARD                   AWARD                   

Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

DIST 2 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
OMAHA & SURROUNDING 
AREA

1500 TN  $            72.50  $   108,750.00 

DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX#1
OMAHA & SURROUNDING 
AREA

2000 TN  $            73.50  $   147,000.00 

DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX#2
OMAHA & SURROUNDING 
AREA

500 TN  No Bid 

DIST 3 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING 
AREA

15000 TN  $            64.50  $   967,500.00  $            79.50  $1,192,500.00  $            67.00  $1,005,000.00 

DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX#1
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING 
AREA

1000 TN  $            70.00  $     70,000.00  $            79.50  $     79,500.00  $            60.00  $     60,000.00 

PG64-22 PG 58S-28

May 1, 2019 4-1-19

Norfolk 2220 Hawkeye Dr. Sioux City IA.

17 C Nebraska SPR

PG64-22

May 1, 2019

Omaha
FMR

PG64-22

May 1, 2019

Omaha
CMR

Sioux City IA

1/2" Surface
PG58-28s

April 15, 2019

FliNN PaviNg Co., Inc.Barkley Asphalt

1

2

3

Li
ne

 # ASPHALTIC CONCRETE

4

PLANT LOCATION
MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

PLANT LOCATION
MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

PLANT LOCATION
MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

PLANT LOCATION

MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

Knife River Midwest, LLC



Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing 6003 OF 
Asphaltic Concrete
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Description Qty UOM Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

FliNN PaviNg Co., Inc.Barkley Asphalt
Li

ne
 # ASPHALTIC CONCRETE Knife River Midwest, LLC

DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX#2
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING 
AREA

500 TN  $            75.00  $     37,500.00  No Bid 

 $          209.50  $1,075,000.00  $          305.00  $1,527,750.00  $          127.00  $1,320,750.00 

PG64-22 PG 58-28

May 1, 2019 4-1-19

Norfolk 2220 Hawkeye Dr. Sioux City IA.

SPL 1M ESAL Surface

Sioux City IA
1/2" Surface High Traffic

PG64-34

June 1, 2019

Sioux City IA

3/8" Surface

April 15, 2019

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms

Required
Net 30

Total

PG 58-28s

Comments

5

6

PLANT LOCATION

MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

PLANT LOCATION
MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE



Buyer: Gayle Callahan-Wolfing 6003 OF 
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Description Qty UOM

DIST 2 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
OMAHA & SURROUNDING 
AREA

1500 TN

DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX#1
OMAHA & SURROUNDING 
AREA

2000 TN

DIST 2 ALTERNATE MIX#2
OMAHA & SURROUNDING 
AREA

500 TN

DIST 3 ASPHALTIC CONCRETE
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING 
AREA

15000 TN

DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX#1
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING 
AREA

1000 TN

1

2

3

Li
ne

 # ASPHALTIC CONCRETE

4

PLANT LOCATION
MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

PLANT LOCATION
MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

PLANT LOCATION
MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

PLANT LOCATION

MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

                  AWARD

Unit Price Ext. Price

 $            66.80  $   100,200.00 

 $            67.80  $   135,600.00 

 $            69.80  $     34,900.00 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

PG 64-22

4-15-19

G Street
3/8 Surface

PG 64-34

4-15-19

G Street
SPR Fine City

PG 64-34

4-15-19

G Street
SPR City

Omni Engineering
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Description Qty UOMLi
ne

 # ASPHALTIC CONCRETE

DIST 3 ALTERNATE MIX#2
NORFOLK & SURROUNDING 
AREA

500 TN

Delivery Days ARO
Payment Terms
Total

Comments

5

6

PLANT LOCATION

MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

PLANT LOCATION
MIX NAME
ASPHALT BINDER

DATE OF MATERIAL WILL BE AVAILABLE

Unit Price Ext. Price

Omni Engineering

 No Bid 

 $          204.40  $   270,700.00 
0 30

5
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